137
PAHANG

ENACTMENT No. 6 of 1990

I ASSENT,

TENGKU ABDULLAH,

(BUAIR. ekt Regent of Pahang

19th day of December 1990

An Enactment to amend the Taman Negara (Pahang)
Enactment 1939.

[ ]

IT IS HEREBY ENACTED by the Legislature of the
State of Pahang as follows:

1. This Enactment may be cited as the Taman Negara shon rite
(Pahang) (Amendment) Enactment 1990 and shall come 2 <o
into force on the date of its publication in the Gazerre.

2. Section 2 of the Taman Negara (Pahang) Enactment :
1939, which in this Enactment is referred to as the
“principal Enactment”, is’amended by—

(a) inserting, immediately after the definiticn of
“animal”, the definition of “forest produce™ as
follows—

“forest produce” has the same meaning
as is assigned to that expression in the
Act 313 National Forestry Act 1984;’; and



Amendment

of section 3.

Amendment

of section 5.

138 PananG No 6 oF 1990

(b) inserting, immediately after the definition of
“Park official”, the definition of “State financial
authority” as follows

“State financial authority” has the same

meaning as is assigned to that

expression in the Financial Procedure
Acrél.  Act 1957;.

3. Section 3 of the principal Enactment is amended by

substituting for subsection (iv) the following—

# (iv) For the purposes only of section 425 of

Act 56. the National Land Code the State Park shall be
deemed to be land reserved for a public
purpose.”.

4. Section 5 of the principal Enactment is amended by

(a) inserting, immediately after the word
“construction” appearing in line one of
paragraph (e) of subsection (i), the word
“management”, and

(b) inserting, immediately after subsection (iii), the
new subsections (iv) and (v) as follows

{1v) For the purposes of sub-section ti;.
the Trusiees shall have the power w enier
into any transaction or arrangement with any
person which in their opinion is calculated to
facilitate the proper discharge of their duty
or is incidental or conducive thereto.

(v) The Trustees shall have the power to
dispose of any forest produce extracted 2+ a
result of any construction and maintenance
carried out in accordance with the purposes
referred to in sub-section (i).”



TAMAN NEGARA (PAHANG) (AMENDMENT) 139

3. The principal Enactment is amended by inserting,
immediately after section 6. a new secticn 6a as
follows—

“Trust 6a. (i) There shall be established in respect of
SEEONAL: rhe State Park a trust account t 1
2 ‘mlcd by the S

. of the State r’ rk.

(ii) The Trustees may make rules to provide
for the manmer m which the trust account
referred to in sub section (i) shall be managed
and controlled ”

6. Section 7 of the principal Enactment is amended by
inserting, immediately after the word “the” appearing in
line two of subsection (i), the word “National™.

7. Section 10 of the principal Enactment is amended by
substituting for paragraph (e) of subsection (ii) the
following—

“(e) prescribe in respect of any contravention of any
Rule penalties not exceeding imprisonment for
three years or a fine of ten thousand ringgit or
in the case of a continuing offence a fine of five
hundred ringgit for every day on which the
offence has been committed.”.

8. Section 11 of the principal Enactment is amended
by

(a) substituting for the words “five hundred
dollars” appearing in line four the words “ten
thousand ringgit”; and

(b) substituting for the words “six months”
appearing in lines four and five the words
“three years”.

New section
6a.

Amendment
of section 7.

Amendment
of section 10.

Amendment
of section 11.



140 PananG No. 6 oF 1990

Amendment 9. Section 12 of the principal Enactment is amended by
of section 12 sybstituting for the words “twenty-five dollars”
appearing in line six the words “five hundred ringgit”.

Amendment  10. Section 13 of the principal Enactment is amended by

of section 13- jnserting, immediately after the word “arrest” appearing
in line four of subsection (i), the words “without
warrant”.

Passed by the Legislative Assembly of Pahang on the
14th day of December 1990.
[SUK. Phg. (DN) 03/0097 Pt. 6; PUN. Phg. (S) 594.]

AB. KHALID BIN MaT,
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly,
Pahang



